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Mimos to lead
TVET curriculum
de v elopment
BUKIT JALIL: Mimos Bhd is ex-
pected to lead the development
of Technical and Vocational Ed-
ucation and Training (TVET) cur-
riculum to prepare the nation for
the Fourth Industrial Revolution
(Industry 4.0).

TVET empowerment commit-
tee head Nurul Izzah Anwar said
the younger generation must be
equipped with the skills to thrive
in Industry 4.0.

“It is a great opportunity for us
to see more cooperation among
the government, industry and in-
stitutions for Industry 4.0,” she
said at the launch of the IR4.0
Driver ’s TVET seminar here yes-
t e rd ay.

On the allocation for TVET, Nu-
rul Izzah said the government
was forced to reduce the amount
to RM180 million this year from
RM300 million previously.

Present were Higher Education
Ministry deputy secretary-gener-
al (management) Datuk Kamel
Mohamad and Mimos president
and chief executive officer Ah-
mad Rizan Ibrahim.
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